

CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI CITY COUNCIL MEETING MAY 20, 2024

The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri duly met on May 20, 2024 at 6:30 p.m. at the Municipal Building in the Council Chambers with Mayor Andrew L. Dawson presiding. Mayor Dawson called the meeting to order and asked for a moment of prayer led by Chaplain Byron Matson followed by the Pledge of Allegiance.

ROLL CALL:

Jack Robinson	Present	Bob Hiller	Present
Thomas Oldham	Present	Bob Cross	Present
Chris Marshall	Present	Rhiannon Foster	Present
Tina Boggess	Present	Steve Bloess	Present

Public Hearing - Annexation Petition - Liahona West, LLC

Mayor Dawson opened the public hearing at 6:32 p.m. The purpose of the public hearing is to consider the annexation petition of Liahona West, LLC.

Legal description:

BEGINNING AT THE INTERSECTION OF THE SOUTHERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF 12TH STREET AND THE EASTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF WINCHESTER DRIVE, IN PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI; THENCE SOUTH 37°20'46" EAST, ALONG SAID SOUTHERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE, 56.06 FEET; THENCE CONTINUING ALONG SAID SOUTHERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE ALONG CURVE TO THE LEFT HAVING A RADIUS OF 275.0 FEET AN ARC DISTANCE OF 177.08 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE CONTINUING ALONG SAID SOUTHERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE, ALONG A CURVE TO THE LEFT HAVING A RADIUS OF 275.0 FEET AN ARC DISTANCE OF 68.22 FEET; THENCE CONTINUING ALONG SAID RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE SOUTH 88°27'20" EAST, 89.19 FEET TO THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF TRACT 1 IN THOMPSON ADDITION PART 8, AN ADDITION TO THE CITY OF SEDALIA, PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI; THENCE SOUTH 01°32'40" WEST, ALONG THE WEST LINE OF SAID TRACT, 600.0 FEET TO THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF SAID TRACT; THENCE NORTH 88°27'20" WEST, 348.26 FEET; THENCE NORTH 01°32'40" EAST, 453.55 FEET; THENCE NORTH 52°39'14" EAST, 246.68 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. BEING A PART OF THE SOUTHWEST QUARTER OF SECTION 6, TOWNSHIP 45 NORTH, OF RANGE 21 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI.

With no public comments, the public hearing closed at 6:34 p.m.

SPECIAL AWARDS:

Fire Chief Matt Irwin presented a Meritorious Service Award to Firefighter Jacob Lamb. While traveling to Kansas City, Firefighter Lamb witnessed a motor vehicle accident resulting in substantial damage to the vehicle. Being a trained and licensed Fire EMT, he stopped to assess the situation and render aid if needed. One person had exited the vehicle but the driver sustained significant injury to his legs and moderate injuries to his face. Firefighter Lamb remained in the vehicle with the 14-year old driver, maintaining cervical spine precautions until Kansas City first responders arrived. While in the vehicle he detected smoke, which turned out to be a fire under the vehicle's dash. Kansas City Fire Department

arrived and Firefighter Lamb assisted with the removal of the patient from the vehicle, provided his assessment to KCFD and remained until no longer needed.

SERVICE AWARDS/RETIREMENT AWARDS: None

MINUTES:

The Council Meeting minutes of May 6, 2024 were approved on motion by Oldham, seconded by Robinson. All in favor.

The Work Session minutes of May 8, 2024 were approved on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster. All in favor.

REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS, COMMISSIONS & COMMITTEES:

The Citizens Traffic Advisory Commission minutes dated April 10, 2024 were accepted on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster. All in favor.

ROLL CALL OF STANDING COMMITTEES:

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT – Chairwoman Rhiannon M. Foster; Vice Chairman Bob Cross

<u>Presentation: Central Business & Cultural District – Annual Report</u>

Chris Paszkiewicz, Chairman of the Sedalia Main Streets Board, presented the FY 2025 budget.

FY 2025 Budgeted Activities:

	-
Grounds Maintenance	\$1,500
Façade Program	\$25,000
Pavilion Restrooms	\$50,000
Murals	\$10,000
Special Events	\$19,900
-Thanksgiving Fireworks	
-Scott Joplin	
-Criterium	
- First Thursdays	
-Quarterly Business Mixer	
-Other Events	
TOTAL Including Administrative Expenses	\$120,880

FY 2024 revenue from the Ad Valorem Tax was \$41,616.00 and anticipated revenue at the same tax rate for FY 2025 is \$42,000.00. The current fund balance is \$187,971.85 and with the FY 2025 revenue, the balance will be \$229,971.85 with a FY 2025 budget of \$120,880.00. The board recommends maintaining the current Ad Valorem tax rate of \$0.8258 per thousand of assessed valuation.

At the May 6, 2024 meeting, a Public Hearing was held regarding the Annexation petition for property owned by E.W. Thompson, Inc. to be transferred to Pettis County Ambulance, Inc. to construct an additional ambulance base. Since the time requirements have been met, Council can now consider the Annexation.

BILL NO. 2024-84, ORDINANCE NO. 12041 – AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI, APPROVING AND ANNEXING AN UNINCORPORATED AREA OWNED BY E.W. THOMPSON INCORPORATED AND PETTIS COUNTY AMBULANCE INCORPORATED INTO THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI, ADJACENT AND CONTIGUOUS TO EXISTING CORPORATE LIMITS OF SAID CITY was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Robinson. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION — Chairwoman Tina Boggess; Vice Chairman Thomas Oldham Financial Update: City Administrator Kelvin Shaw reported on trends from the City's major tax collections. Use tax was down from previous year's sales. Fiscal Year to date it is up \$200,083.00 or 10.1%. The City budgeted a 4% increase which means we are ahead of Budget approximately \$171,000.00 for combined Sales, Use and Marijuana tax. Marijuana tax started in October which is why there is not a history shown for previous year. Franchise tax is quite a bit under but it includes the Class Action Charter Settlement received in April of \$377,818.00. Regarding Transportation taxes, Gas tax is up 4.8%. Vehicle Sales tax is down by 22.5% with Vehicle fees down 36.9%. Property tax currently is flat due to the majority of collections being received in December and January.

Presentation: Volunteer Time Off Policy

Human Resources Director Shannon Ramey-Trull, presented information regarding a Volunteer Time Off Policy. The purpose of the policy is to create or allow community engagement opportunities for City Employees. Benefits include goodwill, community betterment, City relations, morale, employee retention and talent development. The City can benefit by increased public perception, networking and recruiting opportunities. In implementing the policy, there are several considerations which include amount of time off, total cost for the program, term and eligibility, employment status and would it be restricted to 501(c)3 or other opportunities. If Council approves, Human Resources staff will research and draft a policy for Council consideration. Motion by Oldham, seconded by Marshall for staff to draft the Policy. All in Favor.

PUBLIC WORKS – Chairman Bob Hiller; Vice Chairman Tina Boggess

The agreement with Rehrig Pacific Company is for the purchase of an RFID system and software for the Sanitation Department. Scanners will allow for better identification and tracking of missed pickups and route tracking to increase customer service. They will also assist in moving toward a more volume-based service which is instrumental in devising a recycling program. Equipment Cost - \$66,600.00 and Software Cost - \$22,800.00

BILL NO. 2024-85, ORDINANCE NO. 12042 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT FOR THE PURCHASE OF AN RFID SYSTEM AND SOFTWARE FOR SANITATION was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

➤ The Budget Amendment is for upgrading the SCADA System at the Central and Southeast Wastewater Treatment Plants. Cost - \$289,942.00

RESOLUTION NO. 2089 – A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI STATING FACTS AND REASONS FOR THE NECESSITY TO AMEND AND INCREASE THE CITY'S ANNUAL BUDGET FOR FISCAL YEAR 2025 was read once by title and approved on motion by Oldham, seconded by Robinson. All in favor.

BILL NO. 2024-86, ORDINANCE NO. 12043 – AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE BUDGET FOR THE FISCAL YEAR 2024-2025 REGARDING WPC SCADA UPGRADE was read once by title. 2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

3

Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

The agreement with Viking is for painting the City Logo on both water towers. It was voted down at the May 6, 2024 meeting, however, a donor has agreed to cover the remainder of the cost making the project 100% donor funded.

BILL NO. 2024-87, ORDINANCE NO. 12044 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORZING AN AGREEMENT FOR PAINTING OF CITY LOGOS ON BOTH WATER TOWERS BY UTILIZING 100% OF RESTRICTED DONATION FUNDS FOR SAID PROJECT was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

The City received a request from Premium Homes, LLC for connection of property at 2630 James Lane to the City of Sedalia's water distribution system.

BILL NO. 2024-88, ORDINANCE NO. 12045 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN ANNEXATION AND UTILITY SERVICES AGREEMENT FOR CONNECTION OF PROPERTY LOCATED AT 2630 JAMES LANE TO THE CITY OF SEDALIA'S WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Robinson. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Marshall. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

The agreements with S & A Equipment and Builders, LLC are for Storm Drainage Improvements for Project Areas 2 (\$722,925.64), 8 (\$515,914.33), 28 (\$944,883.74) and 30 (\$499,560.34).

BILL NO. 2024-89, ORDINANCE NO. 12046 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT FOR STORM DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS, PROJECT AREA 2 was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

BILL NO. 2024-90, ORDINANCE NO. 12047 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT FOR STORM DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS, PROJECT AREA 8 was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Cross, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

BILL NO. 2024-91, ORDINANCE NO. 12048 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT FOR STORM DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS, PROJECT AREA 28 was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

BILL NO. 2024-92, ORDINANCE NO. 12049 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT FOR STORM DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS, PROJECT AREA 30 was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

> The Citizens Traffic Advisory Committee received a request for a 2-way stop sign at the intersection of West 7th Street and South Beacon Avenue. A study was done and Citizens Traffic Advisory Committee felt it was not needed and it failed. There were 2 accidents at that intersection so a second meeting was held May 20, 2024 and item put to a vote. It passed 3 "yes" to 2 "no" to forward to City Council.

BILL NO. 2024-93, ORDINANCE NO. 12050 – AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING A 2-WAY STOP AT THE INTERSECTION OF WEST 7^{TH} STREET AND SOUTH BEACON AVENUE was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Robinson. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Marshall. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

PUBLIC SAFETY - Chairman Jack Robinson; Vice Chairman Steve Bloess

The agreement with Feld Fire is for the purchase of a Spartan Metro Star Custom Pumper Apparatus for the Sedalia Fire Department. Cost - \$991,205.00

BILL NO. 2024-94, ORDINANCE NO. 12051 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT FOR THE PURCHASE OF A SPARTAN METRO STAR CUSTOM PUMPER APPARATUS FOR THE SEDALIA FIRE DEPARTMENT was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

➤ The Sedalia Police Department received a quote from Flock Group, Inc. for the purchase of License Plate Readers and Condor Stationary cameras. Both systems integrate with each other and alert local law enforcement of flagged vehicles related to illegal activity. It also allows real time information on incidents in progress. One of the stationary cameras will be mounted at Main and Ohio to assist in monitoring train traffic. Cost: 11 Readers – \$73,150.00 and 3 stationary Condor Cameras – \$21,450.00

BILL NO. 2024-95, ORDINANCE NO. 12052 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING A QUOTE FOR THE PURCHASE OF LICENSE PLATE READERS AND CAMERAS FOR THE SEDALIA POLICE DEPARTMENT was read once by title.

2nd Reading – Motion by Foster, 2nd by Oldham. All in favor.

Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2nd by Foster. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

APPOINTMENTS: None

BIDS: Storm Drainage Improvements - Project Areas 2, 8, 28 and 30 - May 6, 2024

<u>LIQUOR LICENSES:</u> The following new and renewal Liquor Licenses were read and approved on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster. All in favor.

New: (Cornhole Tournament – Nucor Pavilion – Missouri State Fairgrounds – June 1, 2024 – 8 a - 5 p)

*Hallye Newton dba Sedalia Lions Club, PO Box 1085, Picnic License

Renewals:

*Henry Hatfield dba E Street Bar 1201 East 3rd, Liquor by the Drink & Sunday Sales

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS FROM MAYOR/COUNCIL/ADMINISTRATOR:

City Administrator Kelvin Shaw thanked Russell and Julie Childers along with all the other donors for making the painting of the City Logos on both water towers. The understanding of the project and deep pride in our community by these individuals and groups is heartwarming. The generosity of all the donors is a part of what makes our community great.

City Administrator Kelvin Shaw addressed concerns on the following topics voiced by citizens during Good and Welfare at the May 6, 2024 Council Meeting:

- 1. Annexation of Walnut Hills and other areas City only entertains voluntary annexations; not aware of any push for involuntary annexations; if City initiates involuntary annexation it requires notice, vote by those affected and the City and affected individuals must both pass.
- 2. Trees in right-of-ways Street Department asked to follow up on trees at the requested address; only preliminary report available, however some limbs not addressed immediately due to down power lines after storm; once cleared, limbs were addressed and trees trimmed; also investigating trees in that area to see if need higher priority on list to be trimmed.
- 3. Extend Pick up time in school zones Schools partner with Police Department on school safety program; request forwarded to Chief of Police; Information being reviewed.
- 4. Soil contamination Old Sutherlands Property City conducted due diligence prior to purchasing property; included Phase 1 and 2 study; City will not put public in danger or at risk to environmental concerns.
- 5. Overtime paid to Police and Fire Rules put in place due to nature of police and fire being 24/7; rules for overtime compensation are different; police and fire compensated in accordance with law.
- 6. Code adoption status Mayor confirmed June time frame; time almost up for review and comment period.

GOOD & WELFARE:

Albert Reine, Jr., 1022 West 7th, made the following requests: A good plan and numbers to rebuild the Wastewater Treatment Plant, all honorably discharged veterans be allowed to pull free building permits to work on their homes, all City Council members receive free trash pickup and refuse containers for life with benefit counted as income on their taxes, all City Council meetings and Board of Public Works meetings be live-streamed on the City's Facebook page, defund Code Enforcement and restructure and for City Administrator Kelvin Shaw to resign.

David Goodson, 1640 Hedge Apple Drive, was following up on his email discussion with City Administrator Shaw from May 8, 2024. He accepted the agreement and followed up again on May 13, 2024, regarding a Resolution to City Council to wrap the agreement up. Mayor Dawson stated he would speak with Mr. Goodson following the meeting. Mr. Goodson stated he believes that meetings should be live-streamed on Facebook. Mr. Goodson directed comments to City Administrator Shaw regarding businesses moving to the County and not selecting Sedalia to build related to Code Enforcement. Mr.

^{*}Lancy Ulrich dba Hampton Inn Sedalia, 3909 West 9th, Liquor by the Drink

Goodson asked what level of responsibility Mr. Shaw takes for the actions of these departments and what job rating he would give himself?

The meeting adjourned at 7:25 p.m. on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster to a closed-door meeting in the upstairs conference room pursuant to subsections 1 (Legal Advice), 2 (Real Estate) and 12 (Negotiated Contracts) of Section 610.021 RSMo. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Robinson, Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No".

The regular meeting reopened and adjourned at 8:11 p.m. on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster. All in favor.

THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI

Andrew L. Dawson, Mayor

Jason S. Myers, City Clerk

BID TABULATION

		0,	Storm D	rainage Im	provem	Drainage Improvements Project Area 2	Area 2			
				May 6,	May 6, 2024 2:00 p.m.	00 p.m.				
				Cour	Council Chambers	nbers				
			S & A Equipm	luipment & Builders, LLC	Genesis Envi	Genesis Environmental Solutions, INC	Orr Wyatt	Orr Wyatt Streetscapes	Corbet	Corbett Construction
			739 Fulton	7398 CR 409 Fulton, MO 65251	B Blue S	8422 S 7 Hwy Blue Springs, MO 64014	6632 Raytov Raytown	6632 Raytown Road, Ste A Raytown, MO 64133	62. Knob No	621 NE 1201 Knob Noster, MO 65336
Description	Units	Qyt.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
Mobilization	SJ	1	\$4,533.27	\$4,533.27	\$30,690.04	\$30.690.04	\$34,150.00	\$34.150.00	\$77.912.48	\$77 912 48
Demolition and Site Preparation	SJ	1	\$56,716.86	\$56,716.86	\$19,442.64	\$19,442.64	\$80,000.00	\$80,000.00	\$69,556.89	\$69,556.89
Traffic Control	รา	П	\$10,869.44	\$10,869.44	\$2,671.96	\$2,671.96	\$10,700.00	\$10,700.00	\$8,596.25	\$8,596.25
Construction Staking	CS	1	\$7,023.39	\$7,023.39	\$9,257.86	\$9,257.86	\$16,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$9,125.25	\$9,125.25
Unclassified Excavation	ζ	200	\$21.75	\$4,350.00	\$13.47	\$2,694.00	\$48.00	\$9,600.00	\$41.00	\$8,200.00
Embankment	ઇ	100	\$34.04	\$3,404.00	\$13.80	\$1,380.00	\$64.00	\$6,400.00	\$241.16	\$24,116.00
Type 1 Curb & Gutter	5	341	\$54.25	\$18,499.25	\$36.37	\$12,402.17	\$42.00	\$14,322.00	\$46.29	\$15,784.89
Type CG-2 Curb & Gutter	5	338	\$55.36	\$18,711.68	\$36.95	\$12,489.10	\$39.00	\$13,182.00	\$46.29	\$15,646.02
Remove and Replace Asphalt Pavement	λ	481	\$93.67	\$45,055.27	\$119.44	\$57,450.64	\$171.00	\$82,251.00	\$162.67	\$78,244.27
Remove and Replace Concrete Pavement	λ	12	\$346.21	\$4,154.52	\$132.47	*30475.30	\$128.00	\$1,536.00	\$157.38	\$1,888.56
					Math Error	\$1,589.64				
Commercial Driveway (8")	λ	205	\$93.51	\$19,169.55	\$148.66	*1620.45	\$128.00	\$26,240.00	\$158.70	\$32,533.50
	-				Math Error	\$30,475.30				
Residential Driveway (6")	λS	15	\$170.12	\$2,551.80	\$108.03	*\$1,714.95	\$123.00	\$1,845.00	\$136.22	\$2,043.30
					Math Error	\$1,620.45				
Gravel Driveway (6")	λς	45	\$26.06	\$1,172.70	\$38.11	*\$3,535.68	\$38.00	\$1,710.00	\$58.05	\$2,612.25
					Math Error	\$1,714.95				
Gravel Irail	≥	87	\$17.76	\$1,545.12	\$40.64	*\$9,546.80	\$38.00	\$3,306.00	\$58.05	\$5,050.35
	-				Math Error	\$3,535.68				
Concrete Sidewalk (4")	-S	823	\$9.07	\$7,464.61	\$11.60	*\$26,964.00	\$10.50	\$8,641.50	\$18.52	\$15,241.96
					Math Error	\$9,546.80				The same of the sa
Concrete Sidewalk (8")	ĸ	1,800	\$10.71	\$19,278.00	\$14.98	*\$15,056.58	\$13.75	\$24,750.00	\$26.45	\$47,610.00
					Math Error	\$26,964.00				
Curb Ramp	EA	7	\$3,273.95	\$22,917.65	\$2,510.94	*\$38,085.12	\$3,000.00	\$21,000.00	\$2,116.00	\$14,812.00
Motornain Bon account		7.00	00000	1	Math Error	\$17,576.58				
watermain kepiacement	5	256	\$108.53	\$27,783.68	\$148.77	*\$11,298.49	\$454.00	\$116,224.00	\$266.96	\$68,341.76
Fire Hydrant Assembly	ΕΔ		C1 AVV V12	C14 44E 13	Math Error	\$38,085.12	24 000 00	000000	2000	70000
	5	4	71.044,416	71.644,415	Math Error	\$11.298.49	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00	\$6,900.34	\$6,900.34
4'X4; Type A Curb Inlet	EA	5	\$6,157.36	\$30,786.80	\$9.121.10	\$8.924.76	\$9.070.00	\$45 350.00	\$10.065.86	\$50 329 30
						2000	2010 10104	20000000	מביירים ו	2000000

					Math Error	\$45,605.50				
4'x5' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	1	\$6,613.71	\$6,613.71	\$8,924.76	*\$36,627.63	\$9,070.00	\$9,070.00	\$10,701.99	\$10,701.99
					Math Error	\$8,924.76				
4'x6' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	3	\$8,988.27	\$26,964.81	\$12,209.21	*\$15,660.49	\$12,800.00	\$38,400.00	\$13,784.73	\$41.354.19
					Math Error	\$36,627.63				
6'X6' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	1	\$10,799.61	\$10,799.61	\$15,660.49	*\$11,872.98	\$16,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$14,994.82	\$14,994.82
					Math Error	\$15,660.49				
5'X5' Junction Box	EA	-	\$7,661.05	\$7,661.05	\$11,872.98	*\$15,306.01	\$8,540.00	\$8,540.00	\$12,624.90	\$12,624,90
					Math Error	\$11,872.98				
6'X8' Junction Box	EA	1	\$10,255.41	\$10,255.41	\$15,306.01	*\$15,292.65	\$8,540.00	\$8,540.00	\$16,226.07	\$16,226.07
					Math Error	\$15,306.01				
8'X8' Junction Box	EA	1	\$10,356.95	\$10,356.95	\$15,292.65	*\$9,201.02	\$11,740.00	\$11,740.00	\$16,316.00	\$16,316.00
					Math Error	\$15,292.65				
4'X4' Side Opening Inlet	EA	1	\$4,823.10	\$4,823.10	\$9,201.02	*\$10,977.87	\$7,470.00	\$7,470.00	\$7,881.09	\$7,881.09
					Math Error	\$9,201.02				
5'X5' Side Opening Inlet	EA	1	\$6,698.70	\$6,698.70	\$10,977.87	*\$14,424.71	\$9,600.00	\$9,600.00	\$11,080.22	\$11,080.22
					Math Error	\$10,977.87				
5'X8' Side Opening Inlet	EA	1	\$8,767.13	\$8,767.13	\$14,424.71	*\$14063.99	\$13,340.00	\$13,340.00	\$19,378.91	\$19,378.91
					Math Error	\$14,424.71				
6'X6' Side Opening Inlet	EA	н	\$7,947.97	\$7,947.97	\$14,063.99	*\$10880.73	\$10,140.00	\$10,140.00	\$14,188.10	\$14,188.10
					Math Error	\$14,063.99				
15" RCP	3	133	\$106.75	\$14,197.75	\$81.81	*\$2,962.96	\$155.00	\$20,615.00	\$94.98	\$12,632.34
					Math Error	\$10,880.73				
18" RCP	L	37	\$105.47	\$3,902.39	\$80.08	*\$3129.39	\$165.00	\$6,105.00	\$101.75	\$3,764.75
					Math Error	\$2,962.96				
24" RCP	5	59	\$144.02	\$4,176.58	\$107.91	\$3,129.39	\$180.00	\$5,220.00	\$116.67	\$3.383.43
24" HDPE	Ŀ	131	\$77.85	\$10,198.35	\$74.54	\$9,764.74	\$150.00	\$19,650.00	\$96.41	\$12,629.71
36" HDPE	5	809	\$91.31	\$55,516.48	\$108.47	\$65,949.76	\$128.00	\$77,824.00	\$113.77	\$69,172.16
48" HDPE	5	259	\$181.90	\$47,112.10	\$166.87	\$43,219.33	\$160.00	\$41,440.00	\$168.24	\$43,574.16
48" RCP	5	129	\$309.06	\$39,868.74	\$303.12	\$39,102.48	\$235.00	\$30,315.00	\$262.91	\$33,915.39
54" Equiv. RCPA	5	315	\$345.25	\$108,753.75	\$393.49	\$123,949.35	\$800.00	\$252,000.00	\$617.61	*\$194,543.36
		Ì							Math Error	\$194,547.15
54" Equiv. RC End Section W/Toe Wall	EA	1	\$9,723.40	\$9,723.40	\$7,439.55	\$7,439.55	\$8,325.00	\$8,325.00	\$5,483.28	\$5,483.28
8" Ductile Iron Pipe	5	10	\$192.46	\$1,924.60	\$2,495.29	\$24,952.90	\$235.00	\$2,350.00	\$384.53	\$3,845.30
Turf Reinforcement Mat	λS	119	\$20.79	\$2,474.01	\$5.68	\$675.92	\$6.00	\$714.00	\$25.13	\$2,990.47
Sodding	7	200	\$34.16	\$6,832.00	\$18.99	\$3,798.00	\$30.00	\$6,000.00	\$11.90	\$2,380.00
Seeding		1,000	\$10.12	\$10,120.00	\$2.00	\$2,000.00	\$2.50	\$2,500.00	\$3.57	\$3,570.00
Erosion Control	SJ	н	\$11,671.15	\$11,671.15	\$6,947.11	\$6,947.11	\$8,530.00	\$8,530.00	\$5,554.50	\$5,554.50
Lid cood IATOT		1				*\$831,095.25		\$1,136,435.50		*\$1,116,730.51
IOTAL base bid				\$747,792.45		\$833,615.25			Math Error	\$1,116,734,30

Alternate										
Description	Units Qyt.	Q,t.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
15" Polypropylene Pipe	1	133	\$73.10	\$9,722.30		No Bid	\$140.00	\$18 620 00		No Rid
18" Polypropylene Pipe	H	37	\$104.85	\$3,879.45		No Bid	\$142.00	\$5 254 00		Dia on
24" Polypropylene Pipe	4	53	\$136.17	\$3,948.93		No Bid	\$150.00	\$4 350 00		Dia ok
48" Polypropylene Pipe	5	129	\$152.93	\$19,727.97		No Bid	\$162.00	\$20.898.00		N Sign
TOTAL Alternate Bid				\$37,278.65				\$49,122.00		
Addendum No. 1				Yes		Yes		Yes		Vac
Anit-Collusion				Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes
Bid Bond				Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes

_
Z
0
$\underline{\smile}$
-
0
=
8
-
_
-
ш

Storm Drainage Improvements Project Area 8 May 6, 2024 2:30 p.m. Council Chambers

				ころう		מכט				
			S & A Equipmer	S & A Equipment & Builders, LLC	Genesis Environ	Genesis Environmental Solutions, Inc	Orr Wyat	Orr Wyatt Streetscapes	Corbett	Corbett Construction
			7398	7398 CR 409	8422	8422 S 7 Hwy	6632 Ray	6632 Raytown Rd, Ste A	621	621 NE 1201
		- 1	Fulton, I	Fulton, MO 65251	Blue Sprir	Blue Springs, MO 64014	Raytow	Raytown, MO 64133	Knob Nost	Knob Noster, MO 65336
Description	Units	9	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
Mobilization	LS	1	\$36,175.14	\$36,175.14	\$28,374.49	\$28,374.49	\$21,500.00	\$21,500.00	\$48,540.84	\$48,540.84
Demolition and Site Preparation	รา	-1	\$21,644.09	\$21,644.09	\$43,066.02	\$43,066.02	\$27,000.00	\$27,000.00	\$47,735.64	\$47,735.64
I raffic Control	SJ	-	\$9,144.36	\$9,144.36	\$2,678.78	\$2,678.78	\$10,800.00	\$10,800.00	\$4,232.00	\$4,232.00
Construction Staking	SJ	П	\$6,368.73	\$6,368.73	\$5,357.55	\$5,357.55	\$16,200.00	\$16,200.00	\$3,967.50	\$3,967.50
Unclassified Excavation	ζ	120	\$18.37	\$2,755.50	\$28.94	\$4,341.00	\$48.50	\$7,275.00	\$41.00	\$6,150.00
Embankment	ઇ	100	\$6.47	\$647.00	\$21.71	\$2,171.00	\$64.50	\$6,450.00	\$241.16	\$24,116.00
Watermain Replacement	5	47	\$155.57	\$7,311.79	\$210.43	\$9,890.21	\$485.00	\$22,795.00	\$415.61	*\$19,949.28
0 0 1	4								Math Error	\$19,533.67
Type I Curb & Gutter	5	24	\$125.62	\$3,014.88	\$59.55	\$1,429.20	\$54.00	\$1,296.00	\$46.29	\$1,110.96
Kemove and Replace Asphalt Pavement	λ	126	\$102.97	\$12,974.22	\$183.13	\$23,074.38	\$173.00	\$21,798.00	\$162.67	\$20,496.42
Concrete Flume (6")	S	112	\$47.73	\$5,345.76	\$68.75	\$7,700.00	\$151.00	\$16,912.00	\$14.10	\$1,579.20
Concrete Sidewalk (4")	Υ _Z	44	\$53.49	\$2,353.56	\$12.51	\$550.44	\$11.00	\$484.00	\$18.52	\$814.88
5.x4. Iype A Curb Inlet	Ę	3	\$6,753.40	\$20,260.20	\$10,053.42	\$30,160.26	\$8,630.00	\$25,890.00	\$10,809.11	\$32,427.33
6.X4' Iype A Curb Inlet	Æ		\$7,647.81	\$7,647.81	\$13,578.65	\$13,578.65	\$10,250.00	\$10,250.00	\$12,825.92	\$12,825.92
6.X6. Type A Curb Inlet	E	7	\$8,709.17	\$17,418.34	\$13,291.17	\$26,582.34	\$12,410.00	\$24,820.00	\$14,994.82	\$29,989.64
8.x4. Iype A Curb Inlet	E	-1	\$8,470.66	\$8,470.66	\$12,326.81	\$12,326.81	\$10,790.00	\$10,790.00	\$13,692.16	\$13,692.16
8.X8' Modified Type A Inlet	E	-1	\$11,063.90	\$11,063.90	\$17,577.21	\$17,577.21	\$15,100.00	\$15,100.00	\$18,777.17	\$18,777.17
/ X4' Side Opening Inlet	EA	7	\$6,288.31	\$6,288.31	\$11,911.60	\$11,911.60	\$10,790.00	\$10,790.00	\$11,130.48	\$11,130.48
/'X/' Side Opening Inlet	EA	2	\$7,730.20	\$15,460.40	\$14,804.68	\$29,609.36	\$14,020.00	\$28,040.00	\$13,774.16	\$27,548.32
/ X/ Junction Box	EA	-1	\$7,408.21	\$7,408.21	\$13,139.73	\$13,139.73	\$14,020.00	\$14,020.00	\$14,091.55	\$14,091.55
15" RCP	5	28	\$91.42	\$5,302.36	\$69.09	\$4,007.22	\$157.00	\$9,106.00	\$94.98	\$5,508.84
18" RCP	5	217	\$90.92	\$19,729.64	\$81.75	\$17,739.75	\$167.00	\$36,239.00	\$101.75	\$22,079.75
24" RCP	5	182	\$108.60	\$19,765.20	\$111.67	\$20,323.94	\$178.00	\$32,396.00	\$116.66	\$21,232.12
48 HUPE	5	170	\$155.80	\$*26,499.60	\$159.75	\$27,157.50	\$162.00	\$27,540.00	\$168.24	\$28,600.80
100			Math Error	\$26,486.00						
48" RCP	4	301	\$297.14	\$89,439.14	\$110.99	\$33,407.99	\$237.50	\$71,487.50	\$262.91	\$79,135.91
48" Equiv. RCPA	4	523	\$323.40	\$169,138.20	\$325.36	\$170,163.28	\$340.00	\$177,820.00	\$343.42	\$179,608.66
48" Equiv. RC End Section	Æ	1	\$5,521.91	\$5,521.91	\$3,686.40	\$3,686.40	\$8,415.00	\$8,415.00	\$3,974.11	\$3,974.11
Turf Reinforcement Mat	λS	181	\$36.56	\$6,617.36	\$5.69	\$1,029.89	\$6.50	\$1,176.50	\$25.13	\$4,548.53
Sodding	λS	900	\$25.35	\$15,210.00	\$18.75	\$11,250.00	\$30.00	\$18,000.00	\$11.90	\$7.140.00
Seeding	λS	800	\$10.46	\$8,368.00	\$2.01	\$1,608.00	\$2.50	\$2,000.00	\$3.57	\$2,856.00
Erosion Control	LS	-	\$10,959.76	\$10,959.76	\$6,696.94	\$6,696.94	\$8,630.00	\$8,630.00	\$3,306.25	\$3,306.25
IOIAL Base Bid				*\$578,304.03		\$580,589.94		\$685,020.00		*\$697,166.26
			Math Error	\$578,290.43					Math Error	\$696,750.65

		İ		The second secon						
Alternate										
Description	Units	Øyt.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
15" Polypropylene Pipe	LF	28	\$78.99	\$4,581.42		No bid	\$143.00	\$8,294.00		No bid
18" Polypropylene Pipe	H.	217	\$60.73	\$13,178.41		No bid	\$147.00	\$31,899.00		No bid
24" Polypropylene Pipe	느	182	\$72.58	\$13,209.56		No bid	\$153.00	\$27,846.00		No bid
48" Polypropylene Pipe	4	301	\$135.85	\$40,890.85		No bid	\$207.00	\$62,307.00		No bid
TOTAL Alternate Bid				\$71,860.24				\$130,346.00		
Addendum No. 1			×	Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes
Anit-Collusion			λ.	Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes
Bid Bond			×	Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes

				BID	BID TABULATION	NOI				
		S	torm Dr	ainage Im	proveme	Storm Drainage Improvements Project Area 28	rea 28			
				May 6,	May 6, 2024 3:00 p.m.	00 p.m.				
				Cour	Council Chambers	bers				
			S & A Equipm	S & A Equipment & Builders, LLC	_	Genesis Environmental Solutions, Inc.	Corbett (Corbett Construction	Orr Wya	Orr Wyatt Streetscapes
			Fultor	/398 CR 409 Fulton, MO 65251	8 Blue Sp	8422 S 7 Hwy Blue Springs, MO 64014	621 Knob Nost	621 NE 1201 Knob Noster, MO 65336	6632 Ra Raytor	6632 Raytown Rd, Ste A Raytown, MO 64133
Description	Units	Qyt.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
Mobilization	S	-	\$65,797.82	\$65,797.82	\$40,439.45	\$40,439.45	\$59,998.52	\$59,998.52	\$44,100.00	\$44,100.00
Demolition and Site Preparation	ี	П	\$43,247.34	\$43,247.34	\$105,819.93	\$105,819.93	\$55,029.23	\$55,029.23	\$42,700.00	\$42,700.00
Traffic Control	S	7	\$10,560.84	\$10,560.84	\$4,003.64	\$4,003.64	\$8,596.25	\$8,596.25	\$10,700.00	\$10,700.00
Construction Staking	รา	П	\$11,023.24	\$11,023.24	\$14,680.02	\$14,680.02	\$14,547.50	\$14,547.50	\$16,000.00	\$16,000.00
lype 1 Curb & Gutter	ا ك	464	\$46.37	\$21,515.68	\$45.69	\$21,200.16	\$46.29	\$21,478.56	\$42.00	\$19,488.00
Commercial Delivers (9")	2	554	\$83.70	\$46,369.80	\$120.95	\$67,006.30	\$162.67	\$90,119.18	\$170.50	\$94,457.00
Peridoctial Driveway (8)	2	2	\$118.11	\$6,732.27	\$126.16	\$7,191.12	\$158.70	\$9,045.90	\$128.00	\$7,296.00
Contrate Sidewalk (4")	לא ל	4/1	\$65.88	\$31,029.48	\$93.41	\$43,996.11	\$136.22	\$64,159.62	\$122.50	\$57,697.50
Cultimeter Sidewalk (4)	h 5	2,31/	\$5.24	\$14,458.08	\$8.97	\$20,783.49	\$18.52	\$42,910.84	\$10.75	\$24,907.75
Watermain Replacement	EA	188	\$1,609.09	533,790.89	\$2,927.00	\$61,467.00	\$2,116.00	544,436.00	\$3,200.00	\$67,200.00
4'X4' Type A Curb inlet	EA	14	\$5,741.44	\$80,380.16	\$9,017.67	\$126,247.38	59.925.68	\$138.959.52	56.930.00	597,020.00
4'X5' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	5	\$6,143.48	\$30,717.40	\$9,980.83	\$49,904.15	\$11,113.28	\$55,566.40	\$8,530.00	\$42,650.00
4'X6' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	ε,	\$6,710.63	\$20,131.89	\$10,564.46	\$31,693.38	\$11,926.62	\$35,779.86	29,060.00	\$27,180.00
4 vo Type A Curo Injet	2	-	57,938.20	57,983.20	\$11,694.39	\$11,694.39	\$13,540.07	\$13,540.07	\$10,130.00	\$10,130.00
5'X5' Type A Curb Inlet	FA	ŀ	S6 207 81	56 207 81	S10 580 13	510 680 13	C11 774 53	C11 774 52	00 000 00	00 000 00
5'X6' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	-	\$6,388.99	\$6,388.99	\$10,546,68	\$10.546.68	\$13,008.43	513,008,43	\$10,130,00	\$10,130,00
6'X5' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	1	\$5,963.36	\$5,963.36	\$11,721.08	\$11,721.08	\$13,209.45	\$13,209.45	\$10,130.00	\$10,130.00
6'X6' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	7	\$8,096.87	\$16,193.74	\$13,322.53	\$26,645.06	\$15,014.66	\$30,029.32	\$11,200.00	\$22,400.00
6'X/' Type A Curb Inlet	EA	-	58,063.63	\$8,063.63	\$12,862.11	\$12,862.11	\$15,067.56	\$15,067.56	\$12,260.00	\$12,260.00
6'X6' lunction Box	2 4	1	\$8 006 87	\$10,103.10	\$11,010,73	\$15,477.63	\$17,904.32	\$17,904.32	\$10,000.00	\$16,000.00
18" HDPE	5 5	426	\$66.05	\$28.137.30	\$60.82	\$25,909.32	\$94.70	\$40.342.44	\$81.00	\$34 506.00
24" HDPE	5	307	\$73.97	\$22,708.79	\$68.05	\$20.891.35	\$96.41	\$29,597.87	\$96.00	\$29.472.00
30" HDPE	프	257	\$109.63	\$28,174.91	\$85.30	\$21,922.10	\$103.76	\$26,666.32	\$107.00	\$27,499.00
36" HDPE	4	251		\$23,227.54	\$95.38	\$23,940.38	\$113.77	\$28,556.27	\$149.00	\$37,399.00
42" HDPE	5	1,282	\$104.73	\$134,263.86	\$138.84	\$177,992.88	\$122.48	\$157,019.36	\$170.50	\$218,581.00
15" RCP	느	34	\$106.64	\$3,625.76	\$70.32	\$2,390.88	\$94.98	\$3,229.32	\$155.00	\$5,270.00
18" RCP	느	321	\$81.71	\$26,228.91	\$75.31	\$24,174.51	\$101.75	\$32,661.75	\$166.00	\$53,286.00
24" RCP	4	143	\$101.99	\$14,584.57	\$109.83	\$15,705.69	\$116.66	\$16,682.38	\$176.00	\$25,186.00
30" RCP	5	34	\$161.67	\$5,496.78	\$120.62	\$4,101.08	\$150.98	\$5,133.32	\$208.00	\$7,072.00
42" RCP	4	170	\$274.43	\$46,653.10	\$151.84	\$25,812.80	\$178.63	\$30,367.10	\$229.00	\$38,930.00
54" Equiv. RCPA	5	236		\$79,569.76	\$382.88	\$90,329.68	\$617.61	\$145,755.96	\$832.00	\$196,352.00
Sodding	S	1,700		\$42,585.00	\$18.68	\$31,756.00	\$11.90	\$20,230.00	\$30.00	\$51,000.00
Erosion Control	S		\$19,405.86	\$19,405.86	\$20,552.02	\$20,552.02	\$5,554.50	\$5,554.50	\$24,530.00	\$24,530.00
IOIAL base bid	$\frac{1}{2}$		1	\$981,755.24		\$1,269,562.74		\$1,373,315.05		*\$1,502,251.25
									Math Error	\$1,502,269.25

	-	-								
Alternate										
Description	Units	Qyt.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
15" Polypropylene Pipe	4	34	\$59.22	\$2,013.48		No bid		No bid	\$140.00	\$4 750 00
18" Polypropylene Pipe	F	321	\$66.62	\$21,385.02		No bid		No bid	\$142.00	\$45 582 00
24" Polypropylene Pipe	F	143	\$80.82	\$11,557.26		No bid		No bid	\$151.00	\$21 593 00
30" Polypropylene Pipe	J.	34	\$73.39	\$2,495.26		No bid		No bid	\$215.00	\$7 310 00
42" Polypropylene Pipe	LF	170	\$130.98	\$22,266.60		No bid		No bid	\$156.00	\$26.520.00
TOTAL Alternate Bid				\$59,717.62						\$105,765,00
Addendum No. 1				Yes		Yes	>	Yes		Vac
Anit-Collusion				Yes		Yes	>	Yes		Vac
Bid Bond				Yes		Yes	>	Yes		Yes

								3ID TAB	BID TABULATION						
						Storm I	Drainage	Improv	Storm Drainage Improvements Project Area 30	ect Area 30					
							May	6, 2024	May 6, 2024 3:30 p.m.						
							ŭ	ouncil C	Council Chambers						
		SRAE	S & A Equipment & Builders, LLC		B & P Excavating, LLC	TB Dozing & E	TB Dozing & Excavation, LLC	Genesis Envir	Genesis Environmental Solutions, Inc.	Corbett Construction	truction	Stockman Co.	Stockman Construction Corp	Orr Wyat	Orr Wyatt Streetscapes
		_	Fulton, MO 65251	Sedaliz	Sedalia, MO 65301	Jamestown	Jamestown, MO 65046	Blue Sp	8422 S 7 Hwy Blue Springs, MO 64014	621 NE 1201 Knob Noster, MO 65336	1201 WO 65336	2021 Idlen Jefferson Ci	2021 Idlewood Road Jefferson City, MO 65109	6632 Ray Raytow	6632 Raytown Rd, Ste A Raytown, MO 64133
Description	Units	Qyt. Unit Price	rice Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Fyt Price	Unit Price	Evt Drice	Hoir Drice	Drice
Mobilization	รา	1 \$39,938.02		\$9,500.00	\$9,500.00	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$37.885.80	\$37.885.80	\$59.998.52	\$59 998 57	\$52,000,00	\$52 000 00	\$30.200.00	Can ann on
Demolition and Site Preparation	ภ	1 \$22,008.70		\$25,720.00	\$25,720.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$60,267.23	\$60,267.23	\$60,960.64	\$60,960.64	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$48,500.00	\$48,500.00
Traffic Control	S	+		\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$7,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$6,583.43	\$6,583.43	\$6,348.00	\$6,348.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$10,800.00	\$10,800.00
Construction Staking	\neg	"	7.74 \$5,507.74	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$6,683.69	\$6,683.69	\$6,612.50	\$6,612.50	\$17,000.00	\$17,000.00	\$16,200.00	\$16,200.00
1ype 1 Curb	5	1,890 530.71	1	\$41.15	\$77,773.50	\$45.50	*\$86,000.00	\$46.67	\$88,206.30	\$46.29	*\$87,483.38	\$39.00	\$73,710.00	\$42.00	\$79,380.00
Remove and Replace Asphalt Payement	5	1 158 \$62.46	45 473 379 69	50.00	20 272 023	Math Error	\$85,995.00	27.000		Math Error	\$87,488.10				
	+		1	305.07	377,877.00	Math Fron	520 000 000	\$133.63	\$154,743.54	\$162.66	\$188,368.97	\$115.00	\$133,170.00	\$172.50	\$199,755.00
Commercial Driveway (8")	+	77 \$101.9	ļ	\$117.81	\$9.071.37	\$205.00	\$15,334,04	6150 30	C41 23E 40	Math Error	\$188,350.28	401.00	47 200 00	00000	00000
Residential Driveway (6")	SY 2	226 \$59.13	13 \$13,363.38	\$105.63	\$23,872.38	\$120.00	\$27,120.00	\$160.20	\$71,353.40	\$136.70	\$12,219.90	\$95.00	57,315.00	\$129.00	\$9,933.00
								200	0	Math Error	\$30,785,72	20000	254,000.00	2113.00	220,634.00
Concrete Sidewalk (4")	SF	30 \$38.19	19 \$1,145.70	\$14.00	\$420.00	\$75.00	\$2,250.00	\$53.09	\$1,592.70	\$18.52	*\$555.45	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$11.00	\$330.00
4	+	+								Math Error	\$555.60				
Watermain Benjacement	EA	30 51,473.99	78 517,687.88	\$1,153.88	\$13,846.56	\$2,400.00	\$28,800.00	\$2,532.74	\$30,392.88	\$2,116.00	\$25,392.00	\$1,150.00	\$13,800.00	\$3,230.00	\$38,760.00
	╀	+	1	2200.00	ממיחחחיכדל	DO:DCT¢	\$4,500.00	5733.24	07.766,95	Math Fron	512,468.27	\$550.00	\$16,500.00	\$485.00	\$14,550.00
Fire Hydrant Assembly	EA	2 \$9,621.55	Ц	\$8,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$8,955.54	\$17,911.08	\$6,900.34	\$13,800.68	\$6,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$4,850.00	89,700.00
4'x4' Type A Curb Inlet	-	+	1	\$9,180.00	\$55,080.00	\$5,750.00	\$34,500.00	\$9,265.71	\$55,594.26	\$9,930.97	\$59,585.82	\$7,100.00	\$42,600.00	\$7,000.00	\$42,000.00
4'x6' Type A Curb Inlet	4	4 \$6,533.49	.49 \$26,133.96	\$10,556.00	\$42,224.00	\$7,175.00	\$28,700.00	\$14,844.92	\$59,379.68	\$12,775.67	*\$51,102.67	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	\$10,240.00	\$40,960.00
A'52' Time A Circh Inlat	5	+	1	00000			1			Math Error	\$51,102.68				
אלי ואלים ביתוח חוופר	+	5 30,113.64	97.757.78	\$10,414.00	970,828.00	\$7,250.00	\$14,500.00	\$11,284.18	\$22,568.36	\$12,827.54	*\$25,655.07	\$9,500.00	\$19,000.00	\$9,700.00	\$19,400.00
15" RCP	LF 2	228 \$67.96	36 \$15,494.88	\$90.33	\$20.595.24	\$122.00	\$27.816.00	\$75.43	\$17 198 DA	Math Error	\$25,655.08	6135.00	620 700 00	00 1013	644 737 00
										Math Error	\$21.655.44	0000000	20.000	00:1010	00.353,546
24" RCP	LF 7	733 \$67.58	\$49,536.14	\$111.78	\$81,934.74	\$175.00	\$128,275.00	\$123.20	\$90,305,60	\$116.66	*\$85,510.11	\$165.00	\$120,945.00	\$226.00	\$165,658.00
000 000	+	200	+							Math Error	\$85,511.78				
or oc	5	_	560,785,95	\$135./1	\$82,104.55	\$210.00	\$127,050.00	\$120.64	\$72,987.20	\$150.98 Math Fron	*\$91,340.84	\$190.00	\$114,950.00	\$258.50	\$156,392.50
Chain Link Fence (48")	1	82 \$98.74	\$8,096.68	\$36.00	\$2,952.00	\$45.00	\$3,690.00	\$31.30	\$2,566.60	\$39.38	*53.229.49	\$62.00	\$5.084.00	\$95.00	00 062 25
	+	\perp	-							Math Error	\$3,229.16				
Wood Fence	SI	83 \$127.34	34 \$10,569.22	\$36.00	\$2,988.00	\$75.00	\$6,225.00	\$67.32	\$5,587.56	\$26.45	\$2,195.35	\$75.00	\$6,225.00	\$113.00	\$9,379.00
Sodding	+	4	+	\$13.70	\$12,672.50	\$25.94	*\$24,000.00	\$19.01	\$17,584.25	\$11.90	*\$11,009.81	\$30.00	\$27,750.00	\$34.50	\$31,912.50
Frosion Control	1	1 40 000 25	35 000 00	42 500 00	00 001 00	Math Error	\$23,994.50	20000		Math Error	\$11,007.50				
	2	7 53,003.	1	52,500.00	57,500.00	58,000.00	\$8,000.00	\$8,087.26	\$8,087.26	\$3,703.00	\$3,703.00	\$4,500.00	\$4,500.00	29,700.00	\$9,700.00
TOTAL Base Bid			\$522,365.08		•\$596,959.50		*\$749,711.00		\$796,821.84		*\$859,991.50		\$873,789.00		\$1,012,426.00
	1			Math Error	\$596,959.90	Math Error	\$749,695.14			Math Error	*\$859,981.51				
	-									Math Error	\$859,978.95				

Alternate	***														
Description	Units Qyt.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Evt Price	Unit Drice	Cot Brice	seise Hell	died to	d diell	100	11-12-0	
15" Polyoropylene Pine	15 238	450 50	¢12 027 27	61100	644 600 00	4440.00	7	OIII LINE	CAL. FILE	Our rine	CXI. FIICE	Oult File	EXt. Price	OUIT PRICE	EXT. Price
24" 2-1	+	1	75.768,614	321.00	\$11,628.00	\$110.00	\$25,080.00		No Bid		No bid	\$132.00	\$30,096.00	\$142.00	\$32,376.00
24 Polypropylene Pipe	LF 733		\$50,041.91	\$77.00	\$56,441.00	\$160.00	\$117,280.00		No Bid		No bid	\$150.00	\$109 950.00	\$152.00	\$111 A16 00
30" Polypropylene Pipe	LF 605	\$74.60	\$45,133.00	\$97.00	\$58 685 00	\$208.00	\$125 840 00		Pig ON		No bid	6155.00	CO DE CO	000000	200000000000000000000000000000000000000
TOTAL Afformate Rid			2000000		2010001000	200000	00:010		NO DIO		DIO ON	DO:COTO	533,623.00	5218.00	5131,980.00
O'ALANCHISIE OIG			\$109,012.23		\$126,754.00		\$268,200.00						\$239,871.00		*\$275,682.00
														Math Error	\$275,772.00
Addendum No. 1			Yes		Yes	×	Yes		Yes	SeV			Vac		Vac
Anit-Collusion			Yes		Yes	×	Yes		Vec	ad A			200		200
Bid Bond			Yes		Yes	>	Vac		200	531			3		9
					0		ú		Yes	Yes			Ves		Yes