

# CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI CITY COUNCIL MEETING APRIL 21, 2025

The City has an on-line broadcast of Council Meetings available both live and recorded by going to "Microsoft Teams".

\*

The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri duly met on April 21, 2025 at 6:30 p.m. at the Municipal Building in the Council Chambers with Mayor Andrew L. Dawson presiding. Mayor Dawson called the meeting to order and asked for a moment of legislative prayer led by Chaplain Byron Matson followed by the Pledge of Allegiance.

### **ROLL CALL:**

Jack Robinson	Absent	Bob Hiller	Present
Thomas Oldham	Present	Bob Cross	Present
Chris Marshall	Present	Rhiannon Foster	Present
Tina Boggess	Present	Steve Bloess	Present

#### **SPECIAL AWARDS:**

Fire Chief Matt Irwin, presented Battalion Chief Barry White with Firefighter of the Year. His leadership, dedication and relentless pursuit of excellence is second to none. His commitment to training and drive to see the Department thrive are a testament to his character. He has earned respect and admiration from those around him. He began his career with the Fire Department in 2001 then deployed with the National Guard to fight terrorism. From day one, he has answered his call no matter the cost, is always there when needed and has been involved in nearly every specialized team in the Fire Department.

## **SERVICE AWARDS/RETIREMENT AWARDS:** None

MINUTES: Motion by Oldham, seconded by Cross to amend the Council Meeting minutes of April 7, 2025 to reflect the correct amount of the proceeds from the DARE Car Show from \$16,859.99 to \$16,234.99. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Motion was then made by Boggess, seconded by Foster to approve the minutes as amended. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

## REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS, COMMISSIONS & COMMITTEES:

The Citizens Traffic Advisory Commission minutes dated March 12, 2025 were accepted on motion by Boggess, seconded by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

#### **ROLL CALL OF STANDING COMMITTEES:**

FINANCE / ADMINISTRATION — Chairwoman Tina Boggess; Vice Chairman Thomas Oldham Financial Update: Finance Director Jessica Pyle stated that Sales and Use Taxes are up Fiscal Year to Date \$1,000,000.00 or 5.4% over last Fiscal Year to Date. An increase of 4% was budgeted and the City is over Budget \$264,000.00. The Marijuana tax collection began in October 2023. Marijuana Taxes represent two months of reporting in the last fiscal year. Franchise tax includes the April 2023 Charter settlement for streaming class action suit for which the City received \$377,818.00 and it is the primary reason for the difference between this Fiscal year and last. The remaining \$200,000.00 decrease is related to the natural gas tax at a decrease of 25.5%. Transportation taxes are higher fiscal year to date as a result of increase Gas Tax of 9.9% Fiscal Year to date. And a vehicle sales tax increase of 4.3% with

vehicle sales remaining flat. Property Tax payments collected over the prior Fiscal Year were \$170,000 more and the majority are received in December and January. Director Pyle stated that for Current Fiscal year there is one month to report for February sales and they are up Fiscal Year to Date over \$58,000.00 or 3.8% which is slightly below budget of 4% by \$3,000.00.

- Motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster to approve a records destruction request from the Finance Department. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.
- The proposed ordinance establishes guidelines for public participation at City of Sedalia meetings to enhance structure, ensure safety, and support orderly conduct of city business. By designating meetings as limited public forums, it reinforces the importance of respectful and relevant dialogue while still encouraging public involvement. The ordinance also provides a designated free-speech zone for political expression, outlines expectations for public comment, and ensures that disruptions are handled fairly.

BILL NO. 2025-72, ORDINANCE NO. 12255 - AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA AMENDING THE CITY CODE REGARDING PUBLIC PARTICIPATION AT OPEN MEETINGS was read once by title. 2<sup>nd</sup> Reading - Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

➤ The proposed ordinance authorizes a temporary extension of the licensed premises for Liberty Center Association for the Arts during the 2025 Scott Joplin Ragtime Festival, scheduled for May 28–31, 2025. The extension allows the organization to include the adjacent sidewalk and street area for the sale of alcoholic beverages as part of the event.

BILL NO. 2025-73, ORDINANCE NO. 12256 - AN ORDINANCE TEMPORARILY EXTENDING THE PREMISES FOR LIBERTY CENTER ASSOCIATION FOR THE ARTS RELATING THE 2025 SCOTT JOPLIN RAGTIME FESTIVAL was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Cross, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Cross, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

# PUBLIC WORKS - Chairman Bob Hiller; Vice Chairwoman Tina Boggess

- > The lease agreement renews the continued operation of the Sedalia Senior Center within the Heckart Community Center. The agreement establishes a five-year term beginning April 1, 2025.
- BILL NO. 2025-74, ORDINANCE NO. 12257 AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING A LEASE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI, SEDALIA PARKS & RECREATION AND THE SEDALIA SENIOR CENTER was read once by title.
- 2<sup>nd</sup> Reading Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.
- The ordinance authorizes the purchase of a Cold Planer PC31 skid steer attachment for the Street Department from Foley Equipment Company through a Sourcewell Agreement that satisfies the City purchasing policy. The total purchase price is \$28,158.60, which includes a \$3,500 trade-in credit for a Bobcat attachment

BILL NO. 2025-75, ORDINANCE NO. 12258 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING A SALES AGREEMENT FOR THE PURCHASE OF A SKID STEER MILL ATTACHMENT FOR THE STREET DEPARTMENT was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

The Water Pollution Control Department identified the need for a dedicated skid steer to support ongoing work at the wastewater treatment facilities. This ordinance authorizes the purchase of a Kubota SVL65 skid steer and bucket from Crown Power & Equipment Co. through the Sourcewell Cooperative Purchasing contract #112624-KBA. The purchase price of \$61,320.73 includes a discount of \$18,923.52.

BILL NO. 2025-76, ORDINANCE NO. 12259 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING A QUOTE FOR THE PURCHASE OF A SKID STEER AND BUCKET FOR THE WATER POLLUTION CONTROL DEPARTMENT was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

The Water Department identified the need for a compact excavator to assist with small-scale water line repairs and maintenance. This request proposes the purchase of a Kubota KX018-4 mini excavator and two buckets from Crown Power & Equipment Co. The purchase will be made through the Sourcewell Cooperative Purchasing contract and includes a discount of \$9,747.36. The final cost to the City is \$32,164.64.

BILL NO. 2025-77, ORDINANCE NO. 12260 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING A QUOTE FOR THE PURCHASE OF A MINI EXCAVATOR AND TWO BUCKETS FOR THE WATER DEPARTMENT was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Marshall. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

➤ The Street Department is requesting approval to purchase a 36-foot, 40,000 lb. gooseneck trailer to transport heavy equipment to job sites. Truck Country in Versailles, Missouri, quoted a price of \$43,024.40 through utilization of the Missouri BUYS cooperative procurement program.

BILL NO. 2025-78, ORDINANCE NO. 12261 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING A QUOTE FOR THE PURCHASE OF A GOOSENECK TRAILER FOR THE STREET DEPARTMENT was read once by title. 2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

Staff applied for and received a grant from the Missouri Division of Tourism to fund wayfinding signage throughout Sedalia. As part of the implementation process, the project was put out for bid. Two bids were submitted, however, both were deemed non-compliant. One bidder failed to acknowledge the required addendums, both used incorrect bid forms, and neither signed and dated the IFB signature page as required. Following consultation with the granting agency and the Sedalia Convention & Visitors Bureau, it was determined that there was not sufficient time remaining in the

current grant cycle to rebid and complete the project successfully. The City was subsequently authorized to reapply for the grant in the next state fiscal year which provides a full grant window from July 1, 2025, through June 30, 2026. The City has since been notified that it has been reawarded the grant and can move forward with the project with a new bidding process. Staff recommends that Council formally reject all bids received related to the fabrication and installation of wayfinding signage. The project will be rebid under the new grant cycle, allowing adequate time for competitive bidding and project completion. Motion by Oldham, seconded by Marshall to formally reject Wayfinding bids. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

The City Council was presented with a proposal to fund roadway and sidewalk rehabilitation along Mill Street, North of 3rd Street. This area is part of a broader redevelopment effort at 521 East 3rd Street by Holland Holding Company, LLC, which is revitalizing a portion of a formerly underutilized property. To support this redevelopment, which includes the Boys & Girls Club of West Central Missouri, future residential apartments, and additional non-profit service facilities, staff recommends approval of an Infrastructure Development Agreement with Holland Holding Company, LLC. Under the terms of the agreement, the Developer will construct stormwater improvements, sidewalks, curbs, and install street lighting along the South and West edges of the project site. These improvements will extend the downtown streetscape and address long-standing drainage issues along Mill Street. The City will reimburse the Developer for up to \$525,000 in certified infrastructure construction costs, amortized over ten years. The City will directly provide the materials and labor for paving Mill Street and supply the light fixtures, which will be installed by the Developer.

BILL NO. 2025-79, ORDINANCE NO. 12262 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN INFRASTRUCTURE DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI AND HOLLAND HOLDING COMPANY, LLC, A MISSOURI LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY was read once by title. 2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Marshall, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Bloess. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

PUBLIC SAFETY - Chairman Jack Robinson, Vice Chairman Steve Bloess - No Report.

<u>COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT</u> – Chairwoman Rhiannon M. Foster; Vice Chairman Bob Cross – No Report.

<u>ACCEPTANCE OF RESIGNATIONS</u>: Motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster to accept the following resignation. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

\* Lee Scribner, Board of Appeals and Zoning Board of Adjustments effective immediately.

BIDS: Wayfinding Signage - April 3, 2025

### **LIQUOR LICENSES:**

The following renewal Liquor Licenses were read and approved on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

\*Jessica Degen dba El Rodeo Mexican Restaurant, 1400 South Limit, Liquor by the Drink & Sunday Sales \*Henry Hatfield dba E Street Bar, 1201 East 3<sup>rd</sup>, Liquor by the Drink & Sunday Sales

The Council Meeting adjourned sine die at 7:00 p.m. on motion by Bloess, seconded by Boggess. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

#### **PLAQUE PRESENTATIONS:**

Mayor Dawson presented plaques to outgoing 2<sup>nd</sup> Ward Councilman Chris Marshall and 4<sup>th</sup> Ward Councilman Steve Bloess.

The newly elected City Council Members were called forward individually and given the Oath of Office by Jason S. Myers, City Clerk, and were presented Certificates of Election and then took their seats at the dais.

Thomas J. Oldham, 1<sup>st</sup> Ward Councilman Lee Scribner, 2<sup>nd</sup> Ward Councilman Bob Cross, 3<sup>rd</sup> Ward Councilman Michelle Franklin, 4<sup>th</sup> Ward Councilman

#### **ROLL CALL:**

Jack Robinson	Absent	Bob Hiller	Present
Thomas Oldham	Present	Bob Cross	Present
Lee Scribner	Present	Rhiannon Foster	Present
Tina Boggess	Present	Michelle Franklin	Present

#### MAYOR PRO-TEM:

Motion by Cross, seconded by Hiller to nominate Councilwoman Foster for Mayor Pro-Tem.

Motion by Boggess, seconded by Cross to cease nominations.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

Rhiannon Foster was elected Mayor Pro-Tem.

# ELECTION OF COUNCIL MEMBER TO SERVE ON PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION:

Motion by Foster, seconded by Oldham to nominate Councilman Scribner to serve as Council member on Planning and Zoning Commission.

Motion by Foster, seconded by Cross to cease nominations.

Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

Lee Scribner elected to serve as Council member on Planning and Zoning Commission.

## **SELECTION AND ANNOUNCEMENT OF COMMITTEE ASSIGNMENTS:**

City Clerk, Jason S. Myers read the list of new chairmen and vice chairmen for Council Committees.

**Public Safety** – Chairperson – Lee Scribner; Vice Chairperson – Jack Robinson; Member Bob Hiller **Community Development** – Chairperson – Rhiannon Foster; Vice Chairperson – Bob Cross; Members – Tina Boggess and Michelle Franklin

Finance & Administration – Chairperson – Tina Boggess; Vice Chairperson – Tom Oldham; Member Lee Scribner

**Public Works** – Chairperson Michelle Franklin; Vice Chairperson – Tina Boggess; Member Rhiannon Foster

Meeting recessed for 30 minutes for a reception in the lobby.

The meeting reopened and adjourned at 7:41 p.m. on motion by Oldham, seconded by Foster to a closed-door meeting in the upstairs conference room pursuant to subsections 1 (Legal Advice), 2 (Real

Estate), 3 (Personnel) and 12 (Negotiated Contracts) of Section 610.021 RSMo. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

The regular meeting reopened at 9:06 p.m. on motion by Oldham, seconded by Cross.

#### **ROLL CALL:**

Present **Bob Hiller** Jack Robinson Absent Present **Bob Cross** Present Thomas Oldham Present Rhiannon Foster Lee Scribner Present Present Michelle Franklin Tina Boggess Present

### **BUSINESS RELATED TO CLOSED DOOR MEETING:**

BILL NO. 2025-80, ORDINANCE NO. 12263 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING A QUIT CLAIM DEED FOR THE SALE OF PROPERTY COMMONLY KNOWN AS 1615 SOUTH MARVIN AVENUE FROM THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI TO SHUDA PROPERTIES was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

BILL NO. 2025-81, ORDINANCE NO. 12264 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AN AMENDMENT TO REAL ESTATE PURCHASE AND SALE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI AND MCDONALD'S USA, LLC, A DELAWARE LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY was read once by title. 2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

BILL NO. 2025-82, ORDINANCE NO. 12265 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING A TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT ON PROPERTY LOCATED AT 632 EAST BROADWAY BOULEVARD TO MCDONALD'S REAL ESTATE COMPANY, A DELAWARE CORPORATION, FOR CONSTRUCTION OF A BUILDING AND RELATED IMPROVEMENTS was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

BILL NO. 2025-83, ORDINANCE NO. 12266 – AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING A STORM SEWER EASEMENT AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI AND MCDONALD'S REAL ESTATE COMPANY, A DELAWARE CORPORATION, ON PROPERTY LOCATED AT 632 EAST BROADWAY BOULEVARD was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Cross. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Foster, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Oldham. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

BILL NO. 2025-84, ORDINANCE NO. 12267 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING A STORM SEWER EASEMENT AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN MCDONALD'S REAL ESTATE COMPANY, A DELAWARE

CORPORATION, AND THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI ON PROPERTY LOCATED AT 632 EAST BROADWAY BOULEVARD was read once by title.

2<sup>nd</sup> Reading – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Final Passage – Motion by Oldham, 2<sup>nd</sup> by Foster. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent. Roll Call Vote: Voting "Yes" were Oldham, Scribner, Boggess, Hiller, Cross, Foster and Franklin. No one voted "No". Robinson was Absent.

The regular meeting adjourned at 9:12 p.m. on motion by Oldham, seconded by Cross. All Present in Favor. Robinson was Absent.

THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI

Andrew L. Dawson, Mayor

Jason S. Myers, City Clerk

		200
		to a

**BID TABULATION** 

			Alternate 1			Description	Wayfinding Signage					TOTAL Base Bid
Wayfinding Signage April 3, 2025 11:00 a.m. Council Chambers					Quantity Purchased	1 to 10	11 to 20	21 to 30	31 to 40	41 to 50		
	Kendall	Attn: M	5100 B	St. Louis	Price per pole - City ROW	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Kendall Industries	Attn: Mark Vickroy	5100 Bulwer Ave.	St. Louis, Mo 63110	Price per Pole - MoDot ROW	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		County Distributing dba	Attn: Tar	1800 Ea	Sedalia	Price per pole - City ROW	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		County Distributing dba Express Banners & Graphics	Attn: Tami Hesseltine	1800 Eagleview Dr.	Sedalia, Mo 65301	Price per Pole - MoDot ROW	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Alternate 2		Kendal Attn: N	Kendail Industries Attn: Mark Vickroy	County Distributing dba	County Distributing dba Express Banners & Graphics Attn: Tami Hesseltine
		5100 B	5100 Bulwer Ave.	1800 Ea	1800 Eagleview Dr.
		St. Loui	St. Louis, Mo 63110	Sedalia	Sedalia, Mo 65301
Description	Quantity Purchased	Price per pole - City ROW	Price per Pole - MoDot ROW	Price per pole - City ROW	Price per Pole - MoDot ROW
Wayfinding Signage - Option 1: Signs to be 2-sided, made from	1 to 10	\$349.00	\$349.00	Pig oN	No Bid
.125" (1/8") DiBond, with digitally printed micro-bead glass	11 to 20	\$333.00	\$333.00	No Bid	No Bid
reflective surface vinyl. Entire sign reflective.	21 to 30	\$333.00	\$333.00	No Bid	No Bid
Price includes FOB 1 shipment of 28 units	31 to 40	\$333.00	\$333.00	No Bid	No Bid
	41 to 50	\$333.00	\$333.00	No Bid	No Bid
Wayfinding Signage - Option 2: Signs to be 2-sided, made from	1 to 10	\$1,011.00	\$1,011.00	No Bid	No Bid
.125" (1/8") solid aluminum, produced as painted Blue	11 to 20	\$1,011.00	\$1,011.00	No Bid	No Bid
Reflective micro-bead white vinyl lettering/arrows, vinyl outline,	21 to 30	\$1,011.00	\$1,011.00	No Bid	No Bid
lettering and arrows only are reflective	31 to 40	\$1,011.00	\$1,011.00	No Bid	No Bid
Price includes FOB 1 shipment of 28 units.	41 to 50	\$1,011.00	\$1,011.00	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL Base Bid				No Bid	No Bid

Alternate 3	Kenda Attn: N	Kendall Industries Attn: Mark Vickroy	County Distributing dba Express Banners & Graphics Attn: Tami Hesseltine	tpress Banners & Graphics Hesseltine
	5100 St. Lou	5100 Bulwer Ave. St. Louis, Mo 63110	1800 Eagleview Dr. Sedalia, Mo 65301	eview Dr. 10 65301
Part	Price Per Part	Total	Price Per Part	Total
12 Ft. Pole of 4" pipe smooth black powder coat	\$200.33	\$5,609.24	C	
4" 12' smooth aluminum sign pole with black finish			\$175.00 (34 parts)	\$5,950.00
V-Loc reusable breakaway anchor for existing concrete			\$143.00 (25 parts)	\$3,575.00
Mini Amerciana Base for 4" diameter pole 10" tall black finish			\$106.00 (34 parts)	\$3,604.00
4" round base black powder coat	\$285.53	\$7,994.84		
4" globe finial with black finish			\$46.00 (34 parts)	\$1,564.00
4" round globe top black powder coat	\$64.73	\$1,812.44		
Hatteras scroll bracket arm black finish inc stainless hardware			\$163.00 (34 parts)	\$5,542.00
24"x34" signs made from .125" Max Metal custom printed double				
sided faces with high intensity prismatic reflective sheeting			\$206.00 (34 parts)	\$7,004.00
Top sign 24" cantilever wing bracket blk powder coated-8"x24"x1/4"	\$45.29	\$1,268.12		
24"x6" classic blade trim with black finish-estimate 3/pole			\$117.00 (102 parts)	\$11,934.00
24"x6" street blades .063" alum. w/double side faces-Est 3/pole			\$54.00 (102 parts)	\$5,508.00
*Bottom signs #4 wing brackets black powder coat - Style A	\$64.49	\$5,417.16		
*Bottom signs #4 wing brackets black powder coat - Style B	\$24.21	\$2,033.64		
*Note: Both styles include 84 Brackets				
Corresponding industry standard vinyl coating	Included with signs	Included with signs		
Additional pieces for MoDOT right of way requirements.	\$52.31	\$1,464.68		
Shipping & Handling				\$1,265.00
TOTAL Alternate Bid with Style A brackets		\$23,566.48		
TOTAL Alternate Bid with Style B brackets		\$20,182.96		
TOTAL Parts + Shipping & Handling				\$45,946.00
**Total includes FOB for 28 signs specified in City & MODOT r-o-w				
Addendum No. 1 & 2		No	Yes	S
E-Verify		Yes	Yes	.5
Anit-Collusion		No	No	0
Tree of the contract of the co		No	No	•